City of Margate
Department of Purchasing
9001 Winchester Avenue
Margate, NJ 08402

Replacement of Four (4) Exterior Doors at the

bid tabulation
Page 1

Project Municipal Building
Garozzo & Scimeca Jersey Architectural Door & Construct Connect
Construction, Inc. Supply Company
Municipality City of Margate
30 Technology Parkway
2922 Fries Mill Road 722 Adriatic Avenue South, Ste 100

County  Atlantic County Williamstown, NJ 08094 Atlantic City, NJ 08401 Norcross, GA 30092
856-881-5978 609-345-0174 856-825-8200
fax 856-881-5975 609-345-4099 fax: 856-692-2175 fax: fax: fax:
christine@garozzoscimec | wichaelblumberg@jerseydoor.co
email aconstruction.com m jderose@metraindustries.com pweaver@wrenvironmental.com
Item # Description Quantity | Unit | Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount
Provide material, equipment, manpower and operator(s) to
purchase, remove and install Door and Frame Complete, Door
1 No 5 (single door). 1 Each $8,161.00 $8,161.00] $13,500.00 $13,500.00
Provide material, equipment, manpower and operator(s) to
purchase, remove and install Door and Frame Complete, Door
2 No 6 (double door with transom). 1 Each $13,307.00 $13,307.00| $22,400.00 $22,400.00
Provide material, equipment, manpower and operator(s) to
purchase, remove and install Door and Frame Complete, Door
3 No 12 (double door). 1 Each $12,675.00 $12,675.00] $19,400.00 $19,400.00
Provide material, equipment, manpower and operator(s) to purchase,
remove and install Door and Frame Complete, Door No 13 (double
4 |door). 1 Each $12,675.00 $12,675.00] $19,400.00 $19,400.00
I herby certify that this is a true copy of the bids received on (Engineer)



mailto:christine@garozzoscimecaconstruction.com
mailto:Michaelblumberg@jerseydoor.com
mailto:jderose@metraindustries.com
mailto:pweaver@wrenvironmental.com
mailto:pweaver@wrenvironmental.com
mailto:Michaelblumberg@jerseydoor.com
mailto:Michaelblumberg@jerseydoor.com
mailto:jderose@metraindustries.com
mailto:christine@garozzoscimecaconstruction.com
mailto:christine@garozzoscimecaconstruction.com

City of Margate

bid tabulation

Department of Purchasing Page 2
9001 Winchester Avenue
Margate, NJ 08402
Total Bid: $46,818.00] Total Bid: $74,700.00] Total Bid: No Bid Total Bid: No Bid Total Bid: No Bid Total Bid: No Bid
Apparent low bidder
Mathematical Error
Replacement of Four (4) Exterior Doors at the
Project Municipal Building
Municipality City of Margate
County  Atlantic County
Item # Description Quantity | Unit | Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount
(Engineer)

I herby certify that this is a true copy of the bids received on




City of Margate bid tabulation
Department of Purchasing Page 3
9001 Winchester Avenue
Margate, NJ 08402

Apparent low bidder

[ Mathematical Error
Required Number of Copies (1): Y/N Yes Y/N Yes Y/N Y/N Y/N Y/N
Bid Deposit/Bond: Y/N Yes Y/N Yes Y/N Y/N Y/N Y/N
Consent of Surety: Y/N Yes Y/N Yes Y/N Y/N Y/N Y/N
Right to Extend - Time for Award: Y/N Yes Y/N Yes Y/N Y/N Y/N Y/N
Stockholder Disclosure Statement: Y/N Yes Y/N Yes Y/N Y/N Y/N Y/N
Non-Collusion Affidavit: Y/N Yes Y/N Yes Y/N Y/N Y/N Y/N
Mandatory Equal Employment Opportunity Language: Y/N Yes Y/N Yes Y/N Y/N Y/N Y/N
NJ Affirmative Action Regulation Complaince Notice: Y/N Yes Y/N Yes Y/N Y/N Y/N Y/N
Required Subcontractors Listing: Y/N Yes Y/N Yes Y/N Y/N Y/N Y/N
Acknowledge of Receipt of Addenda: Y/N Yes Y/N Yes Y/N Y/N Y/N Y/N
Disclosure of Investment Activites in Iran Statement-Two Part Form: Y/N Yes Y/N Yes Y/N Y/N Y/N Y/N
NJ Business Registration Certificate (BRC): Y/N Yes Y/N Yes Y/N Y/N Y/N Y/N
NJ Business Registration Certificate for Subcontractors (BRC): Y/N Yes Y/N Yes Y/N Y/N Y/N Y/N
NJ Public Works Contractors Registration Act Certificate: Y/N Yes Y/N Yes Y/N Y/N Y/N Y/N
NJ Public Works Contractors Registration Act Certificate for Subcontractors: Y/N n/a Y/N n/a Y/N Y/N Y/N Y/N
NJ Debarment List: Y/N Yes Y/N Yes Y/N Y/N Y/N Y/N
Federal Debarment List: Y/N Yes Y/N Yes Y/N Y/N Y/N Y/N
Reference List: Y/N Yes Y/N Yes Y/N Y/N Y/N Y/N
Statement of Authority: Y/N Yes Y/N Yes Y/N Y/N Y/N Y/N
W-9: Y/N No Y/N No Y/N Y/N Y/N Y/N

I herby certify that this is a true copy of the bids received on . (Engineer)




