City of Margate

bid tabulation

Department of Purchasing Page 1
9001 Winchester Avenue
Margate, NJ 08402
Project 2022 Janitorial Services
Abel's Cleaning Agency Daniel Shaw Sarah Qureshi Off Shore Carpet Cleaning ABC Services
Municipality City of Margate Ed Reese
421 South Nector Avenue 235 Newbury Street 494 Broad Street 37 SchoolHouse Road
County  Atlantic County Galloway, NJ 08205 Danvers, MA 01923 Newark, NJ 07102 Cream Ridge, NJ 08514
phone 609-703-1039 351-201-9276 551-4829686 267-315-4764 609-695-1010
November 23, 2021 fax fax 978-560-1162
2022 abonelli@abelscleaningage | danielshea@sj-services.com sgureshio@seiu32bj.rog owner@offshorecarpetcleaning. Carlos@allcleaninc.com
Item # Description Quantity | Unit Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount
Provide any and all necessary material, equipment,
manpower and operator(s) to Perform Janitorial Servies
1 |tothe Municipal Building. 12 |Months|  $1,296.00]  $15552.00 $1.365.84|  $16,300.08 $1,300.00]  $15600.00
Provide any and all necessary material, equipment,
manpower and operator(s) to Perform Janitorial Servies
1a_|to the Municipal Building on a daily basis as-needed. 20 | Days $226.00]  $4,520.00 $171.00 $3,420.00 $240.00 $4,800.00
Provide any and all necessary material, equipment,
manpower and operator(s) to PerformStandard Covid
disinfection treatment program Servies to the Municipal
1C__ |Building as needed. 52 Weeks $150.00 $7,800.00 $50.00 $2,600.00 $225.00 $11,700.00
Provide any and all necessary material, equipment,
manpower and operator(s) to PerformStandard Covid
disinfection treatment program Servies to the Municipal
1D |Building as needed. 60 Days $150.00 $9,000.00 $65.00 $3,900.00 $280.00 $16,800.00
Provide any and all necessary material, equipment,
manpower and operator(s) to Perform Janitorial Servies
2 |tothe Martin Bloom Pavillion. 12 |Months $657.00]  $7,884.00 $875.00]  $10,500.00 $860.00|  $10,320.00
Provide any and all necessary material, equipment,
manpower and operator(s) to Perform Janitorial Servies
to the Martin Bloom Pavillion on a daily as-nedeed basis.
2A 20 Days $65.00 $1,300.00 $110.00 $2,200.00 $80.00 $1,600.00
Provide any and all necessary material, equipment,
manpower and operator(s) to Perform Janitorial Servies
o |to the Martin Bloom Pavillion exterior restrooms. 18 | Weeks $43.00 $774.00 $270.00 $4,860.00 $50.00 $900.00
Provide any and all necessary material, equipment,
manpower and operator(s) to PerformStandard Covid
disinfection treatment program Servies to the Municipal
2C _|Building as needed. 52 Weeks $40.00 $2,080.00 $50.00 $2,600.00 $60.00 $3,120.00
Provide any and all necessary material, equipment,
manpower and operator(s) to PerformStandard Covid
disinfection treatment program Servies to the Municipal
2D |Building as needed. 60 Days $40.00 $2,400.00 $65.00 $3,900.00 $60.00

| herby certify that this is a true copy of the bids received on

(Engineer)



mailto:squreshio@seiu32bj.rog
mailto:owner@offshorecarpetcleaning.com
mailto:Carlos@allcleaninc.com
mailto:abonelli@abelscleaningagency.com
mailto:danielshea@sj-services.com

City of Margate bid tabulation
Department of Purchasing Page 2
9001 Winchester Avenue
Margate, NJ 08402

Project 2022 Janitorial Services

Abel's Cleaning Agency Daniel Shaw Sarah Qureshi Off Shore Carpet Cleaning ABC Services
Municipality City of Margate Ed Reese
421 South Nector Avenue 235 Newbury Street 494 Broad Street 37 SchoolHouse Road
County  Atlantic County Galloway, NJ 08205 Danvers, MA 01923 Newark, NJ 07102 Cream Ridge, NJ 08514
phone 609-703-1039 351-201-9276 551-4829686 267-315-4764 609-695-1010
November 23, 2021 fax fax 978-560-1162
2022 abonelli@abelscleaningage | danielshea@sj-services.com sgureshio@seiu32bj.rog owner@offshorecarpetcleaning. Carlos@allcleaninc.com

Provide any and all necessary material, equipment,
manpower and operator(s) to Perform Janitorial Servies

3 [tothe Margate City Police Department. 12 [ Months $657.00 $7,884.00 $1,365.84 $16,390.08 $800.00 $9,600.00

Provide any and all necessary material, equipment,
manpower and operator(s) to Perform Janitorial Servies
to the Margate City Police Department on a daily as-
3A  |needed basis 20 Days $65.00 $1,300.00 $171.00 $3,420.00 $60.00 $1,200.00

Provide any and all necessary material, equipment,
manpower and operator(s) to Perform Janitorial Servies

4 |tothe Historic City Hall/ Courtroom. 12 Months $161.00 $1,932.00 $708.34 $8,500.08 $250.00 $3,000.00

Provide any and all necessary material, equipment,
manpower and operator(s) to Perform Janitorial Servies
to the Historic City Hall/ Courtroom on a daily as-needed

4A _ |pasis 20 Days $38.00 $760.00 $177.00 $3,540.00 $60.00 $1,200.00
Total Bid:| _ $63,186.00 Total Bid:[No Bid Total Bid:[No Bid Total Bid: $82,220.24 [ $83,440.00]

[ mathematical error BRC X X

apparent low bidder Insurance X X

Iran Disclosure X X

NJ Debarred X X

Fed Debarred X X

Gov. experience X X

| herby certify that this is a true copy of the bids received on . (Engineer)



mailto:squreshio@seiu32bj.rog
mailto:owner@offshorecarpetcleaning.com
mailto:Carlos@allcleaninc.com
mailto:abonelli@abelscleaningagency.com
mailto:danielshea@sj-services.com

City of Margate

bid tabulation

Department of Purchasing Page 3
9001 Winchester Avenue
Margate, NJ 08402
Project 2022 Janitorial Services
Abel's Cleaning Agency Daniel Shaw Sarah Qureshi Off Shore Carpet Cleaning ABC Services
Municipality City of Margate Ed Reese
421 South Nector Avenue 235 Newbury Street 494 Broad Street 37 SchoolHouse Road
County  Atlantic County Galloway, NJ 08205 Danvers, MA 01923 Newark, NJ 07102 Cream Ridge, NJ 08514
phone 609-703-1039 351-201-9276 551-4829686 267-315-4764 609-695-1010
November 23, 2021 fax fax 978-560-1162
2022 abonelli@abelscleaningage | danielshea@sj-services.com squreshio@seiu32bj.rog owner@offshorecarpetcleaning. Carlos@allcleaninc.com
ltem # Description - 2023 Quantity | Unit Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount
Provide any and all necessary material, equipment,
manpower and operator(s) to Perform Janitorial Servies
1 |tothe Municipal Building. 12 |Months|  $1409.00|  $16,908.00 $1502.42|  $18,020.04 $1,380.00]  $16,560.00
Provide any and all necessary material, equipment,
manpower and operator(s) to Perform Janitorial Servies
1a |10 the Municipal Building on a daily basis as-needed. 20 | Days $246.00]  $4,920.00 $188.10 $3,762.00 $240.00 $4,800.00
Provide any and all necessary material, equipment,
manpower and operator(s) to PerformStandard Covid
1c_|disinfection treatment program Servies to the Municipal | 57 | weeks $150.00]  $7,800.00 $55.04 $2,862.08 $225.00]  $11,700.00
Provide any and all necessary material, equipment,
manpower and operator(s) to PerformStandard Covid
1p__|disinfection treatment program Servies o the Municipal | 690 | pays $150.00]  $9,000.00 $71.50 $4,290.00 $280.00|  $16,800.00
Provide any and all necessary material, equipment,
manpower and operator(s) to Perform Janitorial Servies
2 |tothe Martin Bloom Pavillion. 12 |Months $714.00|  $8,568.00 $962.50|  $11,550.00 $1,480.00]  $17,760.00
Provide any and all necessary material, equipment,
manpower and operator(s) to Perform Janitorial Servies
2a |t the Martin Bloom Pavillion on a daily as-nedeed basis. | 30 | pays $71.00|  $1420.00 $121.00 $2,420.00 $80.00 $1,600.00
Provide any and all necessary material, equipment,
manpower and operator(s) to Perform Janitorial Servies
25|10 the Martin Bloom Pavillion exterior restrooms. 18 | Weeks $47.00 $846.00 $297.00 $5,346.00 $50.00 $900.00
Provide any and all necessary material, equipment,
manpower and operator(s) to PerformStandard Covid
2c _|disinfection treatment program Servies to the Municipal | 57 | weeks $40.00|  $2,080.00 $50.50 $2,626.00 $60.00 $3,120.00
Provide any and all necessary material, equipment,
manpower and operator(s) to PerformStandard Covid
oo |disinfection treatment program Servies to the Municipal 60 Days $40.00 $2,400.00 $71.50 $4,290.00 $60.00 $3,600.00

| herby certify that this is a true copy of the bids received on

(Engineer)



mailto:squreshio@seiu32bj.rog
mailto:owner@offshorecarpetcleaning.com
mailto:Carlos@allcleaninc.com
mailto:abonelli@abelscleaningagency.com
mailto:danielshea@sj-services.com

bid tabulation
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City of Margate
Department of Purchasing
9001 Winchester Avenue
Margate, NJ 08402

Project 2022 Janitorial Services
Abel's Cleaning Agency Daniel Shaw Sarah Qureshi Off Shore Carpet Cleaning ABC Services
Municipality City of Margate Ed Reese
421 South Nector Avenue 235 Newbury Street 494 Broad Street 37 SchoolHouse Road
County  Atlantic County Galloway, NJ 08205 Danvers, MA 01923 Newark, NJ 07102 Cream Ridge, NJ 08514
phone 609-703-1039 351-201-9276 551-4829686 267-315-4764 609-695-1010
November 23, 2021 fax fax 978-560-1162
2022 abonelli@abelscleaningage | danielshea@sj-services.com squreshio@seiu32bj.rog owner@offshorecarpetcleaning. Carlos@allcleaninc.com
Provide any and all necessary material, equipment,
manpower and operator(s) to Perform Janitorial Servies
3 |tothe Margate City Police Department. 12 |Months $714.00)  $8,568.00 $1,502.42 $18,029.04 $880.00|  $10,560.00
Provide any and all necessary material, equipment,
manpower and operator(s) to Perform Janitorial Servies
3A [to the Margate City Police Department on a daily as- 20 Days $71.00]  $1,420.00 $188.00 $3,760.00 $60.00 $1,200.00
Provide any and all necessary material, equipment,
manpower and operator(s) to Perform Janitorial Servies
4 |t the Historic City Hall/ Courtroom. 12 |Months $175.00]  $2,100.00 $779.17 $9,350.04 $300.00 $3,600.00
Provide any and all necessary material, equipment,
manpower and operator(s) to Perform Janitorial Servies
AA to the Historic Clty Hall/ Courtroom on a dal'y as-needed 20 DayS $41.00 $820.00 $194.70 $3,89400 $60.00 $1,20000
Total Bid: $66,850.00 Total Bid:[No Bid Total Bid:|No Bid Total Bid: $90,208.20 $93,400.00
[ mathematical error

apparent low bidder

| herby certify that this is a true copy of the bids received on (Engineer)



mailto:squreshio@seiu32bj.rog
mailto:owner@offshorecarpetcleaning.com
mailto:Carlos@allcleaninc.com
mailto:abonelli@abelscleaningagency.com
mailto:danielshea@sj-services.com

City of Margate

bid tabulation

Department of Purchasing Page 5
9001 Winchester Avenue
Margate, NJ 08402
Project 2022 Janitorial Services
Abel's Cleaning Agency Daniel Shaw Sarah Qureshi Off Shore Carpet Cleaning ABC Services
Municipality City of Margate Ed Reese
421 South Nector Avenue 235 Newbury Street 494 Broad Street 37 SchoolHouse Road
County  Atlantic County Galloway, NJ 08205 Danvers, MA 01923 Newark, NJ 07102 Cream Ridge, NJ 08514
phone 609-703-1039 351-201-9276 551-4829686 267-315-4764 609-695-1010
November 23, 2021 fax fax 978-560-1162
2022 abonelli@abelscleaningage | danielshea@sj-services.com squreshio@seiu32bj.rog owner@offshorecarpetcleaning. Carlos@allcleaninc.com
ltem # Description - 2024 Quantity | Unit Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount
Provide any and all necessary material, equipment,
manpower and operator(s) to Perform Janitorial Servies
1 |tothe Municipal Building. 12 |Months|  $1,532.00  $18,384.00 $1,652.66|  $19,831.92 $1,460.00]  $17,520.00
Provide any and all necessary material, equipment,
manpower and operator(s) to Perform Janitorial Servies
1a |10 the Municipal Building on a daily basis as-needed. 20 | Days $267.00]  $5,340.00 $206.91 $4,138.20 $240.00 $4,800.00
Provide any and all necessary material, equipment,
manpower and operator(s) to PerformStandard Covid
1c_|disinfection treatment program Servies to the Municipal | 57 | weeks $150.00]  $7,800.00 $60.50 $3,146.00 $225.00]  $11,700.00
Provide any and all necessary material, equipment,
manpower and operator(s) to PerformStandard Covid
1p__|disinfection treatment program Servies o the Municipal | 690 | pays $150.00]  $9,000.00 $78.65 $4,719.00 $280.00|  $16,800.00
Provide any and all necessary material, equipment,
manpower and operator(s) to Perform Janitorial Servies
2 |tothe Martin Bloom Pavillion. 12 |Months $776.00]  $9,312.00 $1,058.75|  $12,705.00 $1,560.00]  $18,720.00
Provide any and all necessary material, equipment,
manpower and operator(s) to Perform Janitorial Servies
2a |t the Martin Bloom Pavillion on a daily as-nedeed basis. | 30 | pays $77.00]  $1,540.00 $133.10 $2,662.00 $80.00 $1,600.00
Provide any and all necessary material, equipment,
manpower and operator(s) to Perform Janitorial Servies
25|10 the Martin Bloom Pavillion exterior restrooms. 18 | Weeks $51.00 $918.00 $326.70 $5,880.60 $50.00 $900.00
Provide any and all necessary material, equipment,
manpower and operator(s) to PerformStandard Covid
2c _|disinfection treatment program Servies to the Municipal | 57 | weeks $40.00|  $2,080.00 $55.55 $2,888.60 $60.00 $3,120.00
Provide any and all necessary material, equipment,
manpower and operator(s) to PerformStandard Covid
oo |disinfection treatment program Servies to the Municipal 60 Days $40.00 $2,400.00 $78.66 $4,719.60 $60.00 $3,600.00

| herby certify that this is a true copy of the bids received on

(Engineer)



mailto:squreshio@seiu32bj.rog
mailto:owner@offshorecarpetcleaning.com
mailto:Carlos@allcleaninc.com
mailto:abonelli@abelscleaningagency.com
mailto:danielshea@sj-services.com

Project 2022 Janitorial Services

City of Margate
Department of Purchasing
9001 Winchester Avenue
Margate, NJ 08402

bid tabulation
Page 6

Municipality City of Margate

Abel's Cleaning Agency

421 South Nector Avenue

Daniel Shaw Sarah Qureshi

235 Newbury Street 494 Broad Street

Off Shore Carpet Cleaning
Ed Reese

ABC Services

37 SchoolHouse Road

County  Atlantic County Galloway, NJ 08205 Danvers, MA 01923 Newark, NJ 07102 Cream Ridge, NJ 08514
phone 609-703-1039 351-201-9276 551-4829686 267-315-4764 609-695-1010
November 23, 2021 fax fax 978-560-1162
2022 abonelli@abelscleaningage | danielshea@sj-services.com sgureshio@seiu32bj.rog owner@offshorecarpetcleaning. Carlos@allcleaninc.com
Provide any and all necessary material, equipment,
manpower and operator(s) to Perform Janitorial Servies
3 [tothe Margate City Police Department. 12 |Months $776.00|  $9,312.00 $1,652.66|  $19,831.92 $915.00|  $10,980.00
Provide any and all necessary material, equipment,
manpower and operator(s) to Perform Janitorial Servies
3A |10 the Margate City Police Department on a daily as- 20 | Days $77.00]  $1,540.00 $206.91 $4,138.20 $60.00 $1,200.00
Provide any and all necessary material, equipment,
manpower and operator(s) to Perform Janitorial Servies
4 _|tothe Historic City Hall/ Courtroom. 12 |Months $190.00]  $2,280.00 $857.08]  $10,284.96 $300.00 $3,600.00
Provide any and all necessary material, equipment,
manpower and operator(s) to Perform Janitorial Servies
4A to the Historic Clty Hall/ Courtroom on a dal'y as-needed 20 DayS $45.00 $900.00 $214.17 $4,28340 $60.00 $1,20000
Total Bid:| __ $70,806.00 Total Bid:[No Bid Total Bid:[No Bid Total Bid: |[[1$99,22040| $95,740.00
I mathematical error BRC X X X X
apparent low bidder Insurance X X X X
Iran Disclosure X X X X
NJ Debarred X X X X
Fed Debarred X X X X
Gov. experience X No X X
2022 $63,186.00 2022 $82,220.24 2022 $83,440.00
2023 $66,850.00 2023 $90,208.20 2023 $93,400.00
2024 $70,806.00 2024 $99,229.40 2024 $95,740.00
Total:  $200,842.00 Total: $271,657.84 Total: $272,580.00

| herby certify that this is a true copy of the bids received on

(Engineer)



mailto:squreshio@seiu32bj.rog
mailto:owner@offshorecarpetcleaning.com
mailto:Carlos@allcleaninc.com
mailto:abonelli@abelscleaningagency.com
mailto:danielshea@sj-services.com

