## City of Margate Department of Purchasing 9001 Winchester Avenue Margate, NJ 08402

Project	2023 Cleaning and Pipe Video									,					Etal
			Mobile Dredging and Video		Vortex Services		GE Mechanical		Metra Industrial		Equix Integrity Inc.		Wind River Environmental, LLC		
				Pip	e, Inc.										alec .
Municipalit	ty City of Margate			100000	and the second	101501	LIV-lles Deiss	2216 6 1	Main Road	50 Mu	ller Place	10610 Iron B	ridge Road, Ste 1	5 Holla	and Street
				1566 Hard	ling Highway	18150 Imper	al Valley Drive	2310 3 1	Viain Roau			1			D. 15520
County	Atlantic County			Newfield	d, NJ 08344	Houston, TX 77060		Vineland, NJ 08360		Little Falls, NJ 08344		Jessup, MD 20794		Salunga, PA 17538 717-898-8158 x8026	
County		ii ii		856-6	597-1900	201-9	70-6521		325-8200		312-0333	Lance Control of the	812-0333		-8158 x8026
			fax	856-0	697-0757			fax: 850	6-692-2175	fax:		fax:		fax:	
			email	dhuggler@	mdvinc.com	Davea@vorte	xcompanies.com				traindustries.com			Unit Price	nvironmental.com
Item #	Description	Quantity	Unit	Unit Price	Amount	Unit Price	Amount	Unit Price	Amount	Unit Price	Amount	Unit Price	Amount	Unit Price	Amount
	de material, equipment, manpower and operator(s) to									1 1				1 1	
clean	sanitary and storm sewer lines and structures in the City						****	- 1		1 1				1 1	
1 of Ma	argate.	600	Hours	\$351.00	\$210,600.00	\$422.00	\$253,200.00			<del>                                     </del>		-			
Provi	de material, equipment, manpower and operator(s) to							- 1		1 1		1			
	se sanitary and storm sewer lines and structures in the City	1.00		6277.00	\$44,320.00	\$422.00	\$67,520.00	1		1 1					
2 of Ma	argate.	160	Hours	\$277.00	\$44,320.00	\$422.00	\$07,520.00								
Provi	de material, equipment, manpower and operator(s) for			1						1 1		1		1 1	
	gency cleaning services of sanitary and storm sewer lines c City of Margate.	48	Hours	\$1.00	\$48.00	\$422.00	\$20,256.00								
3 in the	e City of Margate.	40	Tiouis	91100											
				The state of	Le la Latina										
														-	
														-	
					Color Colors								<u> </u>	<del>                                     </del>	
				The Market										<del>                                     </del>	
				18 4 10 11 15											
										-					
														1	
										_					
										-					
					\$254,968.00	Total Bid:	\$340,976.00	Total Bid:	No Bid	Total Bid:	No Bid	Total Bid:	No Bid	Total Bid:	No Bid

Apparent low bidder
Mathematical Error

I herby certify that this is a true copy of the bids received on \_\_

(Engineer)

## City of Margate Department of Purchasing 9001 Winchester Avenue Margate, NJ 08402

Project	2023 Cleaning and Pipe Video			
Municipality	City of Margate			
County	Atlantic County			

T. "	Description	Quantity	Unit	Unit Price	Amount										
Item #	Description	Quantity													
1	Provide material, equipment, manpower and operator(s) to clean sanitary and storm sewer lines and structures in the City of Margate.	600	Hours												
2	Provide material, equipment, manpower and operator(s) to televise sanitary and storm sewer lines and structures in the City of Margate.	160	Hours												
	Provide material, equipment, manpower and operator(s) for emergency cleaning services of sanitary and storm sewer lines in the City of	48	Hours												
3	Margate.	10	1100113												
										, A.,					
			-			1									
			-			1									
			-												
						-									

Apparent low bidder Mathematical Error

(Engineer)

## City of Margate Department of Purchasing 9001 Winchester Avenue Margate, NJ 08402

				_			■ I	I 1
Required Number of Copies (1):	Y/N	Yes	Y/N	Yes	Y/N	Y/N	Y/N	Y/N
Bid Deposit/Bond:	Y/N	Yes	Y/N	n/a	Y/N	Y/N	Y/N	Y/N
Consent of Surety:	Y/N	Yes	Y/N	n/a	Y/N	Y/N	Y/N	Y/N
Right to Extend - Time for Award:	Y/N	Yes	Y/N	Yes	Y/N	Y/N	Y/N	Y/N
Stockholder Disclosure Statement:	Y/N	Yes	Y/N	Yes	Y/N	Y/N	Y/N	Y/N
Non-Collusion Affidavit:	Y/N	Yes	Y/N	Yes	Y/N	Y/N	Y/N	Y/N
	Y/N	Yes	Y/N	Yes	Y/N	Y/N	Y/N	Y/N
Mandatory Equal Employment Opportunity Language:	Y/N	Yes	Y/N	Yes	Y/N	Y/N	Y/N	Y/N
NJ Affirmative Action Regulation Complaince Notice:	<u>-</u>		Y/N	n/a	Y/N	Y/N	Y/N	Y/N
Required Subcontractors Listing:	Y/N	n/a	Y/N	Yes	Y/N	Y/N	Y/N	Y/N
Acknowledge of Receipt of Addenda:	Y/N_	Yes		Yes	Y/N	Y/N	Y/N	Y/N
Disclosure of Investment Activites in Iran Statement-Two Part Form:	Y/N	Yes	Y/N		Y/N	Y/N	Y/N	Y/N
NJ Business Registration Certificate (BRC):	Y/N	Yes	Y/N	Yes	Y/N	Y/N	Y/N	Y/N
NJ Business Registration Certificate for Subcontractors (BRC):	Y/N	n/a	Y/N	n/a		Y/N	Y/N	Y/N
NJ Public Works Contractors Registration Act Certificate:	Y/N	Yes	Y/N	n/a	Y/N	1/N Y/N	Y/N	Y/N
NJ Public Works Contractors Registration Act Certificate for Subcontractors:	Y/N	n/a	Y/N	n/a	Y/N		Y/N	Y/N
NJ Debarment List:	Y/N	Yes	Y/N	Yes	Y/N	Y/N	Y/N	Y/N
Federal Debarment List:	Y/N	Yes	Y/N	Yes	Y/N	Y/N		Y/N
Reference List:	Y/N	Yes	Y/N	Yes	Y/N	Y/N	Y/N	
Statement of Authority:	Y/N	Yes	Y/N	Yes	Y/N	Y/N	Y/N	Y/N
W-9:	Y/N	No	Y/N	No	Y/N	Y/N	Y/N	Y/N